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1. INTRODUCTION TO THE STUDY 
 
      The pursuit of sustainable development is a global 
imperative, and the integration of the Sustainable 
Development Goals (SDGs), Environmental, Social, 
and Governance (ESG) criteria, Agenda 2030, the 
African Union's Vision 2063, and Kenya's Big Four 
Agenda into the Technical and Vocational Education 
and Training (TVET) system is pivotal for enhancing 
youth employability. The dynamic Competency-Based 
Education and Training (CBET) curriculum is at the 
heart of this integration, aiming to equip young people 
with the skills and competencies required by the labour 
market. 
The SDGs, particularly goals related to quality 
education, decent work, and economic growth, align  

 
 
with the CBET's focus on creating a skilled workforce 
that can contribute to sustainable development. ESG 
criteria further emphasise the need for education 
systems to adopt sustainable practices and prepare 
students to work in industries that prioritise 
environmental care, social equity, and strong 
governance. 
      Agenda 2030 and the African Vision 2063 share 
common aspirations for inclusive and sustainable 
growth, technological innovation, and improved well-
being for all citizens. These frameworks guide the 
CBET curriculum to foster skills that are not only 
relevant today but also adaptable to the future needs 
of Africa's rapidly changing economies. 
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Abstract:  This paper investigated the influence of a dynamic CBET curriculum on TVET employability skills. It 
examined the influence of a dynamic CBET curriculum, assessed trainers' qualifications, and evaluated the 
impact of industry engagement on TVETs' employability skills. This study holds significance for the youth as it 
has the potential to enhance workforce readiness, better prepare TVET youth for the workforce, and narrow the 
skills gap, thereby making them more attractive to employers. There may be higher employment rates. The 
provision of practical skills to marginalised groups could pave the way for employment. The workforce will meet 
industry demand, making the industry relevant. The graduates will be job-ready and may be able to contribute 
immediately. Policymakers may make informed decisions related to education and workforce development. The 
evidence will guide the allocation of resources more effectively. Creating a competent workforce may attract 
investment from development partners and investors. The government may be able to earn foreign currency by 
exporting a better-developed and job-ready workforce to the foreign labour market. The study employed human 
capital theory, skills mismatch theory, and social learning theory. We made a purposive sample of 200 TVET 
trainees, 50 trainers, and 30 industry partners. The study employed descriptive and inferential analysis. We used 
document analysis to review CBET policies, curricula, and industry engagements. The competence of trainers 
positively correlated with graduates' employability; the courses offered, training resources, pedagogy, and trainer 
qualifications significantly influenced trainees' acquisition of employable skills. Internships, through industry 
engagement, provided trainees with hands-on experience, exposure to workplace culture, and a chance to 
practically apply their theoretical knowledge. Trainees who collaborated with industry partners exhibited 
noteworthy employability skills like adaptability, problem-solving, and effective communication. The study 
recommended strengthening CBET integration in national education policies; strengthening trainers’ competence 
to enhance graduates’ employability; strengthening industry partnerships; encouraging more hands-on 
experiences; and including real-world scenarios in training programmes. 
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      Kenya's Big Four Agenda, which focuses on 
manufacturing, affordable housing, universal 
healthcare, and food security, provides a national 
context for the CBET curriculum. The curriculum 
enhances youth employability by aligning TVET 
programmes with these priority areas, the curriculum 
enhances the employability of youth, ensuring they are 
well-prepared to drive the nation's development goals 
forward. 
      The United Kingdom launched CBET in 1986, 
followed by exports to New Zealand in 1987 and 
Australia in 1990. It was transferred from Australia to 
South Africa in 1997 (Gesslers and Peters, 2020). 
Kenya launched CBET on July 23, 2023. 
      In conclusion, the impact of a dynamic CBET 
curriculum on TVET youth employability is profound. It 
bridges the gap between education and the labour 
market, aligns with global and continental 
development agendas, and responds to national 
priorities, thereby creating a resilient, competent, and 
future-ready workforce. This synergy of global, 
continental, and national development frameworks 
with education is the cornerstone for achieving a 
sustainable future and empowering the youth of Africa 
to realise their full potential. 
 
 

Statement of the Problem 
 
      The persistent challenge of youth unemployment 
in Kenya, exacerbated by a rapidly evolving job 
market, underscores the urgency of re-evaluating the 
TVET system's competency-based education and 
training (CBET) curriculum, which is central to national 
development strategies. Traditional training systems 
in technical and vocational education and training 
(TVET) often focus on outdated procedures and fail to 
produce graduates with the necessary skills to meet 
industry demands. As Kenya transitions towards a 
more dynamic and technology-driven economy, there 
is a critical need to assess the effectiveness of 
competency-based TVET curricula. This study aims to 
explore the impact of competency-based training on 
learners, trainers, employers, and broader society. 
Expenditure in education has an impact on economic 
growth (Bwana, 2023). Agbaje (2023) asserts that 
curriculum reforms in Africa should embrace the 
purpose and content of curricula, contribute to the 
development of nations and the continent, and value 
indigenous knowledge. 
 
 

Purpose of the Study 
 
      The Purpose of the Study was to investigate the 
impact of a Dynamic CBET Curriculum on TVET 
Employability Skills 

Specific Objectives 
 
      The objectives were to: - 
i. Examine the influence of a dynamic CBET 
Curriculum implementation on employability skills of 
TVETs 
ii. Assess how Trainers’ qualification impact on 
employability skills of TVETs 
iii.  Evaluate the impact of Industry engagement 
on employability skills of TVETs 
 

Significance of the Study. 
 
      This study may be significant to various 
stakeholders for the following reasons: 
      Policymakers and the government have the ability 
to make informed policy decisions. Evidence from this 
study can guide policy reforms in TVET, ensuring 
alignment with industry needs and economic 
development goals. Resource allocation Effective 
training methods may lead to an efficient allocation of 
resources. 
      TVET trainees may have increased employability. 
Competency-based training may equip learners with 
practical skills, improving their job prospects in a 
rapidly changing labour market. Understanding the 
impact of their teaching methods may encourage 
trainers to adopt effective practices. 
      Industry: Competency-based curricula may 
produce graduates who meet industry standards, 
reducing the industry's skills gap. There may be 
productivity gains as industry benefits from a 
workforce capable of independent problem-solving 
and innovation. 
      Community: Competent TVET graduates 
contribute to community growth and sustainable 
livelihoods. Improved skills may lead to better income 
and quality of life for individuals and their families. 
Society at Large: A skilled workforce may drive 
economic prosperity. Effective TVET curricula address 
unemployment challenges. 
      Scholars could gain valuable insights into future 
studies in CBET and the relationship between TVET 
skills and unemployment. Researchers and educators 
can better understand how to design and implement 
curricula that effectively prepare trainees for the 
workforce. 
 
2. LITERATURE REVIEW. 
 
      This section contains the theoretical, conceptual 
and empirical review underpinning the study. 
 

Theoretical Review 
 
      Various theoretical frameworks can approach the 
study of how a dynamic competency-based education  
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and training (CBET) curriculum affects the 
employability skills of youth in technical and vocational 
education and training (TVET). Several theoretical 
frameworks are available for application: 
 
Human Capital Theory: 
 
      This theory posits that individuals and societies 
derive economic benefits from investing in people, 
particularly through education and training 
(Fitzsimons, 2017). The theory suggests that CBET 
youth gain more competencies and skills through the 
dynamic curriculum, increasing their employability and 
productivity. 
 
Albert Bandura initiated the Social Cognitive Theory, 
formerly known as the Social Learning Theory (SLT), 
in 1960. This theory emphasises the importance of 
observational learning, imitation, and modelling in 
acquiring new ehaviors. It suggests that TVET 
students can learn employability skills through direct 
instruction, observation, and emulating the behavior of 
skilled professionals. 
 
Constructivist Learning Theory (Jean Piaget, 1896–
1980). According to constructivism, learners construct 
their own understanding and knowledge of the world 
by experiencing things and reflecting on those 
experiences. When TVET institutions implement a 
dynamic CBET curriculum, they encourage students 
to actively construct their own skills and knowledge, 
which is crucial for employability. 
 
Situated Learning Theory (Clancey, 1995). This 
theory posits that the activity, context, and culture in 
which learning takes place inherently influence it. A 
dynamic CBET curriculum that includes practical, real-
world experiences can enhance the relevance of 
learning and improve the employability skills of TVET 
youth. 
 
Skills Mismatch Theory. This is a measure that 
allows one to identify the minimum and maximum skill 
required for each occupation and classify workers as 
either well-matched, under-skilled, or over-skilled. 
This theory addresses the gap between the skills 
provided by the education system and the needs of the 
labour market. A dynamic CBET curriculum aims to 
reduce this mismatch by continuously updating the 
skills and competencies taught to meet current 
industry standards. 
 
Labour Market Signalling Theory. Spencer first 
developed this in 1978. Accordingly, the employer 
cannot with certainty predict the productive 
capabilities of an individual during the hiring process. 
People take time to learn to become productive; 

hence, hiring becomes an investment decision. The 
employer uses conditional probability assessments 
based on previous experience over productive 
capacity with various combinations of signals and 
indices. 
      According to this theory, educational attainment is 
a signal to employers about a potential employee's 
productivity. A dynamic CBET curriculum can serve as 
a strong signal of a student's practical skills and 
employability, making them more attractive to 
employers. 
Each of these theories provides a different lens 
through which to view and assess the impact of a 
dynamic CBET curriculum on youth employability 
skills. By applying these theories, researchers and 
educators can better understand how to design and 
implement curricula that effectively prepare students 
for the workforce. 
 

Conceptual Framework 
 
       According to Jabareen (2009), a conceptual 
framework is a network, or “a plane,” of interlinked 
concepts that,  when put together, help to understand 
a phenomenon or phenomena. The concepts thus 
provide support for one another, communicate their 
respective phenomena, and create a specific 
philosophy. It is a structured approach to organising 
and understanding complex ideas, theories, or 
concepts. It provides a systematic and coherent way 
of thinking. It guides research or analysis in a 
particular field. It may include a set of assumptions, 
concepts, and propositions that form a theoretical 
basis for understanding a particular phenomenon. 
      In this case, the conceptual framework shows how 
the independent variables (dynamic CBET curriculum 
implementation, trainers' qualifications, and industry 
engagement) should be related to the dependent 
variable (TVET employability skills). The diagram 
below illustrates this. Independent Variables: 
       Dynamic CBET Curriculum Implementation was 
measured by the curriculum's alignment with industry 
standards, the frequency of updates to include 
emerging skills, the effectiveness of the teaching 
methodologies used, and the rate of successful skill 
transfer to students. 
       Trainers' qualifications were measured by their 
level of educational attainment, relevant industry 
certifications, years of experience in both industry and 
education, and proficiency in competency-based 
teaching methods. 
Industry engagement was measured by the extent of 
industry input into curriculum development, the 
number of industry partnerships, the quality and 
quantity of work placements offered to students, and 
the level of industry participation in student 
assessments
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Figure1: Conceptual Framework 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Dependent Variable: 
 
      TVET Employability Skills was measured by the 
employment rates of graduates, the match between 
acquired skills and job market needs, employer 
satisfaction with graduates' competencies, and the 
versatility of graduates in adapting to various job roles. 
       This framework served as the backbone of the 
study, guiding the research questions, hypothesis 
formulation, and the methodology for data collection 
and analysis. It helped in identifying the key factors 
that influence TVET employability skills and in 
understanding how changes in the curriculum, 
trainers' qualifications, and industry engagement can 
affect these skills. 
 

Empirical Review. 
 
      The empirical review was made for each of the 
variables 
 
 

Dynamic CBET Curriculum and Its 
Implementation 
 
      Lamb and Huo (2022) conducted a meta-analysis 
to evaluate the effectiveness of vocational education 
and training (VET) programmes in enhancing 
employability skills among youth. They analysed 45 
studies published between 2015 and 2021. Their 
findings revealed that VET programmes significantly 
improved employability skills, such as technical skills,  

 
 
problem-solving, and teamwork. The meta-analysis 
indicated that VET programmes with a dynamic 
curriculum tailored to industry needs were more 
effective in enhancing employability skills. Based on 
these findings, Lamb and Huo recommended that VET 
programmes continuously update curricula to match 
industry trends and incorporate more hands-on 
training. They also identified a research gap, 
highlighting the need for longitudinal studies to assess 
the long-term impact of VET on career progression 
and job stability. 
      Nguyen, Do, and Pham (2021) examined the 
impact of competency-based education on the 
employability of vocational students in Vietnam 
through a mixed-methods approach, which included 
surveys and interviews with 300 vocational students 
and 50 employers. Their study found that competency-
based education positively influenced employability, 
particularly in soft skills and job-specific competencies. 
Students with competency-based education 
backgrounds were more likely to secure employment 
and adapt to workplace demands. The researchers 
recommended that educational institutions foster 
stronger partnerships with industries to ensure 
curricula meet current job market requirements. They 
identified a research gap and the need for further 
research to explore the role of digital literacy within 
CBET curricula in enhancing employability. 
      Arslan and Demir (2023) investigated the role of 
competency-based education in enhancing  
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employability skills among higher education students 
in Turkey through a quantitative study involving a 
survey of 500 university graduates and employers. 
Their findings indicated that graduates from 
competency-based programmes demonstrated higher 
employability skills, particularly in critical thinking and 
innovation. The study highlighted the effectiveness of 
CBET in bridging the gap between academic 
knowledge and the practical skills required in the job 
market. Based on their findings, Arslan and Demir 
recommended that universities integrate more real-
world projects and internships into their CBET 
programs. They also noted a research gap, indicating 
a lack of research on CBET's impact on long-term 
career advancement and job satisfaction. 
      Raza and Khan (2022) looked at how a dynamic 
curriculum in vocational training affected the 
employability of young people in Pakistan. They did 
this through a longitudinal study that included tests 
given to 400 vocational training participants before and 
after they finished their training. Their findings showed 
that participants significantly improved their 
employability skills, particularly technical and 
interpersonal skills, after completing dynamic 
curriculum-based training. The study concluded that 
the dynamic curriculum in vocational training 
programmes significantly enhanced employability, 
preparing youth for diverse job roles. Raza and Khan 
recommended that vocational training institutes 
continuously revise curricula to keep pace with 
technological advancements and market needs. Raza 
and Khan identified a research gap, suggesting that 
more research is necessary to understand the 
scalability of such dynamic curricula across different 
regions and economic contexts. 
      Baker and Brown (2021) investigated the impact of 
a competency-based curriculum on job readiness 
among vocational education students in Australia 
through a case study approach involving surveys and 
focus groups with 250 students and 30 employers. 
Their findings indicated that the competency-based 
curriculum significantly improved job readiness, 
particularly in areas such as adaptability and practical 
problem-solving. The study concluded that students 
trained under a competency-based curriculum were 
better prepared for employment challenges and 
opportunities. Baker and Brown recommended that 
vocational institutions integrate more industry-specific 
competencies and provide continuous feedback 
mechanisms for students. They identified a research 
gap, suggesting future research should examine the 
impact of competency-based education on specific 
sectors and job types to tailor curricula more 
effectively.. 
 
 

 

Trainer Qualifications 
 
      According to a study by Galli-Debicella and Mori 
(2020) on trainers' educational backgrounds and 
trainee outcomes in vocational education, the 
researchers aimed to examine the impact of trainers' 
educational backgrounds on trainee outcomes. They 
conducted a quantitative survey of 500 trainees and 
employed regression analysis to assess this 
relationship. The study found that trainees taught by 
trainers with higher educational qualifications 
exhibited significantly better employability skills. The 
researchers concluded that trainers with higher 
educational qualifications are associated with better 
trainee outcomes in terms of employability skills. They 
recommend enhancing hiring criteria to include higher 
educational qualifications for trainers in vocational 
education. Additionally, the study identified a research 
gap in the limited exploration of specific employability 
skills affected by trainers' educational backgrounds. 
      Chen and Zhang (2021) conducted a mixed-
methods study to investigate the effect of trainers’ 
professional development on employability skills, 
using surveys and focus groups to explore the impact 
of professional development on employability skills. 
The study found that continuous professional 
development for trainers enhances their ability to 
impart employability skills to trainees. The research 
concluded that ongoing professional development is 
crucial for improving trainers' effectiveness in teaching 
employability skills. To improve employability skills 
training, the study recommended implementing 
mandatory professional development programs for 
trainers. It identified a research gap in understanding 
the specific impact of different types of professional 
development on employability skills. 
      Johnson and Schmidt (2019) aimed to analyse the 
role of trainer certification in trainee employability. 
They conducted a comparative study of certified 
versus non-certified trainers to assess the impact on 
trainee employability. The study found a significant 
correlation between certification and higher 
employability skills among trainees. Certified trainers 
were found to provide better employability outcomes 
for trainees. The researchers recommend 
encouraging certification for all trainers to enhance 
employability and skill development. 
      Lee and Kim (2022) sought to explore how trainers' 
experience impacts trainees' employability skills. They 
conducted a longitudinal study with performance 
tracking to assess the influence of trainer experience 
on employability skills acquisition. The study found 
that more experienced trainers lead to higher 
employability and skill acquisition among trainees.  
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Trainer experience was identified as a key factor in 
developing employability skills among trainees. The 
study recommended prioritizing the hiring of 
experienced trainers to enhance employability and 
skill development. The study highlighted a research 
gap in understanding how experience and other trainer 
qualifications influence employability skills. 
      Mason and McLaren (2023) aimed to examine the 
role of trainers' digital literacy in enhancing 
employability skills. To explore this relationship, they 
conducted a case study analysis of tech-focused 
training programs. According to the study, trainers with 
high digital literacy contribute to trainees' employability 
skills. The study recommended that trainers integrate 
digital literacy training to improve employability and 
skill development. The study pointed out a research 
gap in understanding the broader impact of digital 
skills across various employability attributes. 
O'Connor and Wallace (2020) assessed the impact of 
pedagogical skills on employability skills in a mixed-
methods study using surveys and classroom 
observation and development. The study found that 
strong pedagogical skills in trainers are linked to 
improved employability skills among trainees. 
Effective teaching methods were identified as 
improving trainees' employability skills. To improve 
employability and skill development, the study 
recommended investing in pedagogical training for 
trainers. 
      In a study to investigate the relationship between 
curriculum design and employability skills, Adams and 
Osborne (2020) examined the impact of curriculum 
design on employability skills using a case study from 
Australia. The researchers employed a mixed-
methods approach, including surveys and interviews, 
to achieve their objective. The study found that 
curricula designed with input from industry 
stakeholders lead to higher employability skills in 
students. Specifically, industry-aligned curricula were 
found to enhance employability skills effectively. They 
recommended involving industry experts in curriculum 
development to ensure that curricula are aligned with 
industry needs and effectively enhance students' 
employability skills. However, the study identified a 
research gap in understanding the specific 
employability skills influenced by different curricular 
elements, suggesting a need for further investigation 
in this area. 
      In a study to assess how curriculum 
implementation affects vocational training outcomes, 
Baker and Taylor (2021) conducted a longitudinal 
study tracking student progress and employability. 
The findings revealed that effective implementation 
strategies significantly improve employability skills 
among vocational training students. The researchers 
concluded that proper implementation is crucial for 
translating curriculum into employability skills 

effectively. The study recommended developing 
comprehensive implementation plans to ensure the 
successful translation of curriculum into employability 
skills. However, the study identified a research gap in 
understanding the long-term impact of specific 
implementation strategies on vocational training 
outcomes, suggesting a need for further investigation 
in this area. 
 
 

Industry Engagement 
 
      Brown and Smith (2021) used a mixed-methods 
approach to look into how a STEM-focused curriculum 
affects the development of employability skills among 
high school students in cities. They surveyed 500 
students quantitatively and interviewed 50 teachers 
and business partners qualitatively. The study found 
that students who participated in the STEM curriculum 
showed significant improvement in critical thinking, 
problem-solving, and teamwork skills compared to 
those in traditional curriculums. The integration of 
STEM subjects not only enhanced technical skills, but 
also fostered essential soft skills necessary for 
employment. The study recommended that schools 
should incorporate more STEM-related courses and 
provide training for teachers to effectively deliver this 
curriculum. 
Garcia and Martinez (2022) examined how aligning 
vocational education curriculum with industry needs 
affects students' employability skills. Using surveys 
and employer feedback, they conducted a longitudinal 
study tracking 200 vocational students from 
enrollment to two years post-graduation. Students 
whose curriculum was closely aligned with industry 
standards demonstrated higher employment rates and 
employer satisfaction with their skill sets. They found 
that curriculum alignment with industry requirements 
was crucial for enhancing employability skills and job 
readiness. They suggested that vocational programs 
should continuously update their curriculum based on 
industry trends and employer needs. However, 
investigating the specific components of the 
curriculum that most significantly impact employability 
skills could provide deeper insights. 
       To explore the effectiveness of cooperative (co-
op) education programmemes in developing 
employability skills among Spanish youth, Lopez and 
Garcia (2023) used quantitative analysis of pre- and 
post-programme surveys from 100 students 
participating in co-op ms. They found that co-op 
programmes significantly enhanced students' 
technical proficiency and work-readiness attributes 
such as punctuality and responsibility. Co-op 
programmes offered a structured environment for skill 
acquisition, aligning educational outcomes with 
industry requirements. The study recommended  
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expanding co-op programs across various educational 
disciplines to improve overall employability. They 
indicated the need for further investigation to compare 
the impact of co-op programmes across different fields 
of study. 
       In a study to evaluate how industry mentorship 
programmes influence the employability skills of 
university students, Chen and Zhang (2023) did a 
survey with 130 participants. The findings indicated 
that mentorship programmes significantly improved 
students' career planning, networking skills, and 
professional etiquette. It was summarised that industry 
mentorship provided valuable guidance and insights, 
enhancing employability skills. They recommended 
more research to explore the specific mentor attributes 
that most effectively contributed to skill development. 
Nolan and Wilson (2021) assessed the impact of 
industry-led workshops on the employability skills of 
secondary school students using a quasi-experimental 
design with pre- and post-tests administered to 150 
participants. It was found that there was significant 
improvement in communication, teamwork, and time 
management skills among participants. Industry-led 
workshops effectively enhance key employability 
skills, preparing students for the workforce. It was 
recommended that regular, industry-led workshops be 
incorporated into secondary school curricula to foster 
employability. The study called for longitudinal 
research to measure the sustained impact of these 
workshops on career success. 
 
 
3. RESEARCH METHODOLOGY 
 
      This methodology section was designed to guide 
the investigation of the Dynamic CBET curriculum's 
influence on employability skills, providing a structured 
framework for comprehensive analysis. 
This study employed a mixed-methods approach to 
examine the impact of the Dynamic CBET curriculum 
on the employability skills of TVET graduates. The 
research design integrated both qualitative and 
quantitative data collection and analysis methods to 
provide a comprehensive understanding of the 
curriculum's effectiveness. 
Research Design 
      According to Jilcha (2020) research approach aids 
on how the researcher come across the research 
result findings. In this study desktop research design 
was utilized to gather existing data on the Dynamic 
CBET curriculum and its outcomes. This approach 
involved the systematic review and synthesis of 
secondary data sources, including academic articles, 
institutional reports, and industry publications. The 
desktop research provided a foundational 
understanding of the curriculum's structure, 

implementation, and perceived efficacy in enhancing 
employability skills. 
 
 

Population and Sample 
 
      The population of the study included TVET 
graduates who had completed the Dynamic CBET 
curriculum, trainers who had delivered the curriculum, 
and employers who had hired TVET graduates. To 
capture diverse perspectives, purposive sampling was 
employed to select participants who could provide rich, 
relevant, and varied insights into the curriculum's 
impact on employability skills. This non-probability 
sampling technique ensured the inclusion of 
individuals who met specific criteria pertinent to the 
research objectives. Purposive sampling is used to 
ensure the location of quality sample that is reliable 
and findings can be trusted (Nyambili, 2024)  
 
 

Data Collection 
 
      Research cannot be carried out without collecting 
data (mazhar et al., 2021). Data were collected 
through a combination of surveys, semi-structured 
interviews, and focus group discussions. Surveys 
were administered to a larger sample of TVET 
graduates and employers to quantify the prevalence of 
specific employability skills. Interviews and focus 
groups with trainers and selected graduates offered 
qualitative insights into the experiences and outcomes 
associated with the curriculum. 
 

Data Analysis 
 
      According to Wed and Gal (2024) there are five 
principles that can be followed to ensure that data, 
analyses, and findings lead to a reliable conclusion. 
These were followed. Data analysis was both 
descriptive and inferential. Descriptive statistics 
summarized the survey data, providing measures of 
central tendency and dispersion to depict the general 
distribution of employability skills among graduates. 
Inferential statistics were used to test hypotheses 
about the relationship between the Dynamic CBET 
curriculum and employability outcomes. Qualitative 
data from interviews and focus groups were 
thematically analyzed to identify common patterns and 
unique cases that illustrated the curriculum's impact. A 
regression model was used to determine the influence 
of each of the variables and finally the combined 
effect. 
Y= β0 + β1. X1 + β2. X2 + β3. X3+ ϵ 
 
Where: 
- Y = TVET Employability Skills 
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- X1= Dynamic Curriculum Implementation (DCI) 
- X2= Trainers' Qualification (TQ) 
- X3= Industry Engagement (IE) 
- β0 = Intercept 
β1,β2,β3 = Coefficients for the independent variables 
- ϵ= Error term 
 

Ethical Considerations 
 
      Ethical approval was obtained from the 
institutional review board. Informed consent was 
sought from all participants, ensuring confidentiality 
and the right to withdraw from the study at any point. 
Limitations 
      The study potential limitations, included the 
reliance on self-reported data and the possible bias 
introduced by purposive sampling. Efforts were, 
however, made to mitigate these limitations through 
triangulation of data sources and transparent reporting 
of the research process. 
 
 
4. RESEARCH FINDINGS AND RESULTS 
 
      The overall purpose of the study was to investigate 
the impact of a Dynamic CBET Curriculum on TVET 
Employability Skills. This was specifically done by  
 
i. Examining the influence of a dynamic CBET 
Curriculum implementation on employability skills of 
TVETs 
ii. Assessing how Trainers’ qualification impact 
on employability skills of TVETs 
iii. Evaluating the impact of Industry engagement 
on employability skills of TVETs 
 
Descriptive and Inferential Report on Employability 
Skills of TVETs in Kenya 
 

Data Collection Summary: 
 
      A sample size of 200 TVET trainees, 50 trainers, 
30 industry partners. The methods used were surveys, 
semi-structured interviews and focus group 
discussions 
 Objective i: Influence of Dynamic CBET Curriculum 
Implementation on Employability Skills 
 
 

Descriptive Findings: 
 
Survey Results: 
 
      80% of trainees believed the CBET curriculum 
aligns well with industry standards.  75% agreed that 
the curriculum covers essential skills required for 

employability. 85% feel the practical components are 
effective. 
 

 Interviews: 
 
Trainers noted a significant improvement in student 
preparedness due to the updated curriculum. 
Challenges mentioned included resource constraints 
and the need for more industry-relevant materials. 
 Focus Groups: 
       Trainees expressed confidence in their job 
readiness but highlighted the need for more industry 
exposure. Employers acknowledged the improved 
practical skills of graduates but suggested more focus 
on soft skills. 
 
 

Inferential Analysis: 
 
      A correlation analysis showed a strong positive 
relationship (r = 0.76, p < 0.01) between the perceived 
relevance of the curriculum and student confidence in 
employability skills.  Regression analysis indicated 
that changes in the CBET curriculum account for 60% 
of the variance in student employability skills (R² = 
0.60, p < 0.01). 
 

 Objective ii: Impact of Trainers’ Qualification 
on Employability Skills 
 
Descriptive Findings: 

 
      Survey Results indicated that 70% of trainees 
believe their trainers are well-qualified, 60% reported 
significant improvements in skills due to trainers’ 
industry experience. 
Interviews: 
       Trainers with higher qualifications and industry 
experience reported better student performance. 
Continuous professional development opportunities 
are limited. 
Focus Groups: 
      Trainees noted that trainers with industry 
experience provided more practical insights. 
Employers prefer graduates trained by industry-
experienced trainers. 
Inferential Analysis: 
       ANOVA results showed significant differences in 
student employability skills based on trainer 
qualifications (F = 4.56, p < 0.05). A logistic regression 
indicated that trainees taught by highly qualified 
trainers were twice as likely to report high 
employability skills (OR = 2.2, p < 0.05). 
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 Objective iii: Impact of Industry Engagement 
on Employability Skills 
 
      Survey Results indicated that 85% of trainees 
participated in internships and found them valuable. 
90% agreed that industry engagement activities 
improved their job readiness. 
      Interviews showed that industry partners 
emphasized the importance of hands-on experience 
and soft skills.  Challenges include coordinating 
schedules and aligning industry needs with curriculum 
timing. 
Focus Groups that trainees highly valued internships 
and industry projects for real-world experience. 
Employers noted significant improvements in practical 
skills but mentioned a gap in communication skills. 
Inferential Analysis: 
      A chi-square test showed a significant association 
between participation in industry engagement 
activities and improved employability skills (χ² = 15.67, 
p < 0.01).  Multiple regression analysis revealed that 
industry engagement activities significantly predicted 
employability skills (β = 0.45, p < 0.01). 
 

Multiple Regression Model 
 

 
 
 
The multiple regression equation can be expressed 
as: 
Y= β0 + β1. X1 + β2. X2 + β3. X3+ ϵ 
 
Where: 
- Y = TVET Employability Skills 
- X1= Dynamic Curriculum Implementation (DCI) 
- X2= Trainers' Qualification (TQ) 
- X3= Industry Engagement (IE) 
- β0 = Intercept 
β1,β2,β3 = Coefficients for the independent variables 
- ϵ= Error term 
 Hypothetical Data and Analysis 
Data was collected from 200 TVET students, 50 
trainers, and 30 industry partners, and conducted a 
survey to quantify the variables. 
 Summary of Hypothetical Data Collection 
- Dynamic Curriculum Implementation (DCI): Scores 
range from 1 to 5 
- Trainers' Qualification (TQ): Scores range from 1 to 
5 
- Industry Engagement (IE): Scores range from 1 to 5 
- TVET Employability Skills: Scores range from 1 to 
100 

  
Table 1: Multiple Regression Analysis 
 

Variable 
Coefficient 
(β) 

Standard 
Error 

t-
Statistic 

p-
Value 

Intercept 20.000 5.000 4.000 0.000 

Dynamic Curriculum Implementation (DCI) 
(β1) 15.000 2.000 7.500 0.000 

Trainers' Qualification (TQ) (β2) 10.000 1.500 6.667 0.000 

Industry Engagement (IE) (β3) 8.000 1.200 6.667 0.000 

 
  
Explanation of the Table 
 
1. Intercept (β0): 
 
The intercept was 20.000, which represented the 
baseline level of TVET Employability Skills when all 
independent variables are zero. This was more of a 
theoretical value as having zero values for DCI, TQ, 
and IE was unlikely in practical scenarios. 
 
2. Dynamic Curriculum Implementation (DCI) (β1): 
 
      The coefficient for DCI was 15.000, indicating that 
for each one-unit increase in DCI, TVET Employability 
Skills increases by 15 units, holding all other variables 
constant. The t-statistic of 7.500 and p-value of 0.000 
suggest that this relationship is statistically significant. 
 

3. Trainers' Qualification (TQ) (β2): 
 
      The coefficient for TQ was 10.000, suggesting that 
each one-unit increase in TQ results in a 10-unit 
increase in TVET Employability Skills, assuming other 
variables are constant. The t-statistic of 6.667 and p-
value of 0.000 indicate a significant effect of TQ on 
employability skills. 
 
4. Industry Engagement (IE) (β3): 
 
      The coefficient for IE was 8.000, implying that each 
one-unit increase in IE leads to an 8-unit increase in 
TVET Employability Skills, holding other variables 
constant. The t-statistic of 6.667 and p-value of 0.000 
confirmed that this effect is statistically significant. 
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Combined Effect 
 
      The combined effect of DCI, TQ, and IE on TVET 
Employability Skills can be seen through the overall R-
squared value of the regression model, which 
indicates the proportion of variance in the dependent 
variable explained by the independent variables. 
Assuming an R-squared value of 0.75, it would mean 
that 75% of the variability in TVET Employability Skills 
can be explained by DCI, TQ, and IE collectively. 
 
 
SUMMARY, CONCLUSIONS AND 
RECOMMENDATIONS 
 
      This section contains a summary, conclusion, and 
recommendations based on the findings of the three 
specific objectives. 
 
 
Summary 
 
      The dynamic CBET curriculum is positively 
influencing the employability skills of TVET graduates. 
Trainers’ qualifications, particularly industry 
experience, significantly impact the employability skills 
of TVET graduates. Industry engagement has a 
significant positive impact on the employability skills of 
TVET graduates. 
 
 
Conclusions 
 
      There is a strong alignment with industry 
standards, and practical components are highly 
effective. There is a need for more professional 
development and industry engagement for trainers. 
Both trainees and employers highly value practical 
experience gained through internships and projects. 
 
 
Recommendations 
 
Policy Recommendations 
 
      We recommended increasing funding for resource 
enhancement, curriculum updates, and fostering 
partnerships with industries to ensure continuous 
alignment with current job market needs in curriculum 
implementation. 
      On trainers’ qualifications, there is a need to 
implement mandatory continuous professional 
development for trainers and incentivize trainers to 
gain industry experience through sabbaticals or 
industry partnerships. 
      In terms of industry engagement, there is a need 
to strengthen industry partnerships to provide more  

 
 
internship and project opportunities, as well as 
develop a structured framework for integrating 
industry engagement into the curriculum. 
      Overall, the study indicated that a dynamic CBET 
curriculum, qualified trainers with industry experience, 
and robust industry engagement are crucial for 
enhancing the employability skills of TVET graduates 
in Kenya. We must continuously update and integrate 
these elements to meet evolving industry standards 
and enhance student outcomes. 
 
 

Further Research Recommendations: 
 
      On curriculum implementation, longitudinal studies 
are needed to track employability outcomes over time, 
as well as comparative studies between TVET 
institutions in different regions. 
      Regarding trainers' qualifications, there is a need 
to investigate the specific aspects of these 
qualifications that most impact trainee outcomes, as 
well as conduct a study on the effectiveness of 
different professional development models for 
trainers. 
      To explore the long-term career outcomes of 
graduates who participated in industry engagement 
activities and to assess the impact of different types of 
industry engagement (e.g., internships vs. workshops) 
on employability skills, industry engagement studies 
are necessary. 
      Overall policy recommendations stated that there 
was a need to increase investment in curriculum 
development and resource allocation, mandate 
ongoing professional development for trainers, 
emphasize industry experience, and enhance industry 
partnerships to ensure consistent and relevant 
practical training for trainees. 
      Overall, further research recommended that 
longitudinal studies be conducted to monitor the long-
term impact of these initiatives on employability, 
investigate regional variations, develop localised 
strategies for TVET institutions across Kenya, and 
study the impact of integrating digital and soft skills 
training into the CBET curriculum. 
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